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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Meter & Valve Box Components

TIME & (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 20, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Group 1 RECTANGULAR METER BOXES AND TRAFFIC BEARING STEEL LIDS UNIT    
400 ea. PRICE 58.40 49.00 NO BID

1. #2 Meter Box (SAWS #9858) TOTAL 23,360.00 19,600.00  
300 ea.          UNIT  
No. 1 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13581) (Lids will be marked with SAWS water jet cut in PRICE 101.01 102.00 NO BID

2. 2" block letter at 1/2 depth) TOTAL 30,303.00 30,600.00  
500 ea. UNIT  
No. 2 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13582) (Lids will be marked with SAWS water jet cut in PRICE 130.01 139.00 NO BID

3. 2" block letter at 1/2 depth) TOTAL 65,005.00 69,500.00  

  *  

  NO BID

 TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 118,668.00 119,700.00  

Group 2 OVAL METER BOXES UNIT    

3,300 ea. PRICE 27.17 29.00 29.52

1. Oval Meter Box (SAWS #9853) TOTAL 89,661.00 95,700.00 97,416.00

UNIT

5,000 ea. PRICE 39.09 42.00 40.70

2. Oval Lid (SAWS #13577) TOTAL 195,450.00 210,000.00 203,500.00

   *

   

 TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 285,111.00 305,700.00 300,916.00

Group 3 VALVE BOX COMPONENTS UNIT

 350 ea. PRICE 25.40 22.50 25.82

1. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS #9877) TOTAL 8,890.00 7,875.00 9,037.00

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 7.12 7.75 8.18

2. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS#10273) TOTAL 4,272.00 4,650.00 4,908.00

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 12.70 13.70 16.54

3. 9" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 9" (SAWS #9833) TOTAL 7,620.00 8,220.00 9,924.00

UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 18.80 20.30 25.54

4. 15" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 15"  (SAWS #9834) TOTAL 2,820.00 3,045.00 3,831.00

UNIT

20 ea. PRICE 14.88 20.00 15.65

5. Valve Box cap, size 6" Division (SAWS #10270) TOTAL 297.60 400.00 313.00

UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 8.00 8.60 14.81

6. Valve Box cap, Size 6" Open Left (SAWS #10271) TOTAL 1,200.00 1,290.00 2,221.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 14.88 18.00 15.65

7. Valve Box cap, size 6" Open Right (SAWS #10272) TOTAL 1,488.00 1,800.00 1,565.00

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 38.61 41.00 124.91

8. 10" Monument Box Traffic bearing sewer cleanout DI  (SAWS #15893) TOTAL 11,583.00 12,300.00 37,473.00

 *

 

TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 38,170.60 39,580.00 69,272.50

Group 4 TRAFFIC BEARING COMPOSITE LIDS UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 41.14 NO BID 147.91

1a. No. 2 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic bearing, Mfg: Nicor; P/N 15X25WNL (SAWS #38978) TOTAL 41,140.00  147,910.00

1,000 ea. UNIT

No. 2 Meter Box frame 1/4" X 2" X 2" Angle 1-1/2 X 2" Flat Bar, Mfg: Nicor; P/N PRICE 129.00 NO BID 29.09

1b. B16BLKHDS-SAWS (frame will be marked with SAWS stamped in 1" block letter) (SAWS #43880) TOTAL 129,000.00  29,090.00

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 22.72 NO BID 139.72

2a. No. 1 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic Bearing, Mfg: Nicor; P/N 12X18WNL (SAWS #38979) TOTAL 13,632.00  83,832.00

600 ea. UNIT

No. 1 Meter Box Frame 1/4" X 1/2" X 1/2" Angle 1/2" X 1/4" Flat Bar 1/2" X 1" Flat Bar PRICE 100.89 NO BID 17.67

2b.

Mfg: Nicor; P/N B9BLKHDS-SAWS (frame will be marked with SAWS stamped in 1" block letter

(SAWS #43881) TOTAL 60,534.00  10,602.00

*

TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 244,306.00 NO BID 271,434.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Meter & Valve Box Components

TIME & (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 20, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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Group 5 INCIDENTAL TRAFFIC BEARING COMPOSITE LIDS UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 71.39 77.00 73.21

1.

No. 2 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic bearing incidental Mfg: DFW Plastic, P/N DFWMB17821-1A

SAWS-LID   (SAWS #39028) TOTAL 178,475.00 192,500.00 183,025.00

*

TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 178,475.00 192,500.00 183,025.00

TOTAL AWARD TOTAL 864,730.60

 EXTENSION 1  864,730.60

ESTENSION 2 864,730.60

EXTENSION 3 864,730.60

EXTENSION 4 864,730.60

Net Net 2%

 Terms 30 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery   

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Act Pipe & Supply Hydro Pro Solutions Demandstar

AY McDonald KLP Commercial SAWS Website

Core & Main Master Tech Line Pipe

Corix Milford Online

Ferguson Water Works Morrison Supply

Fortiline Waterworks Scruggs

Gajeske

2


